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Open Additional Accounts (Features and Fees) 

 

Type 
Current Account Checking Account Tawfeer Plus Savings 

Account 
E-Youmaty Tawfeer Everyday Cash Saving 

 
 
 

Feature 
 

With QNB Current 
Account, offered in 
Egyptian Pound and 
the major foreign 
currencies, you can 
freely deposit and 
withdraw funds at any 
time and access all 
banking transactions. 

With QNB Checking 
Account offers you the 
convenience and 
flexibility of a Current 
Account without 
sacrificing the benefit 
of gaining interest. 

With QNB Tawfeer Plus 
tiered Savings Account in 
EGP, the more you save 
in your account, the 
higher interest you gain. 

Now, in few minutes 
you can easily open E—
Youmaty Tawfeer saving 
account in EGP with a 
few simple steps 
through the Internet 
Banking Service 

Maximize Your Savings 
with Everyday Cash 
Saving Account in EGP 
from QNB.  
Enjoy the benefit of daily 
interest credit to your 
account calculated 
according to tier. 

 
Minimum 
Balance 

 

 
EGP 2,500 

Or Equivalent of USD 
1,000 

EGP 10,000 OR 
USD 3,000 

OR 
EUR 3,000 

Opening EGP 1,000 
To earn interest starting 

from EGP 20,000 

EGP 50,000 to enjoy 
interest 

Earn interest starting 
from 

EGP 350,000. 

Open 
Fees 

Free  
When applying through 

internet or Mobile 
banking  

Free  
When applying through 

internet or Mobile 
banking  

Free  
When applying through 

internet or Mobile 
banking 

Free 
Available only on 

internet and Mobile 
banking 

Free  
When applying through 

internet or Mobile 
banking  

Service Charges 
EGP 85 or Equivalent 

/Quartey 
EGP 85 or 

Equivalent /Quartey 
EGP 85 or 

Equivalent /Quartey 
No Service Charges EGP35/Monthly 

Interest Rate N/A 
EGP 2.5 % 
USD 0.25% 

EURO 0.15% 

Tiers starting from 5 % 
till 23.50 % 

Tiers starting from 4 % 
till 8.75 % 

Tiers starting from 13 % 
till 22.50 % 

Interest 
Posting 

N/A Monthly Monthly Monthly Daily 


